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Introduction: 
 
 
 
 

Age Group Hours on Screen/Day** 

Kids (8-12 years-old)1  
 

Teenagers (13-18 years-old)2  
 

Parents3  
 

**Many studies recommend 2 hours or less per day 
 
What Effect is Excessive Screen Time Having? 

  
o “Adolescents who spend more than seven hours a day on screens were twice as likely as 

those spending one hour to have been diagnosed with anxiety or depression.”4 

o “Teens who spend more time on screens are more likely to be depressed, and those 

who spend more time on non-screen activities are less likely to be depressed.”5 

o “Teens who are the most active on social media are also those who are most in danger 
of developing depression.”6 

  
o “The loneliest teens are those who spend more time on social media and less time with 

their friends in person.”7 

o “The number of teens who get together with friends nearly every day dropped by more 

than 40 percent from 2000 to 2015.”8 

  
o See Adam Alter’s book Irresistible: The Rise of Addictive Technology and the Business of 

Keeping Us Hooked 
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THESIS: Excessive screen time degrades God’s design for us, our relationships, and the church 
 
 
Humanity 

God’s Design Excessive Screen Time 

  
 
 
“I'm not thinking the way I used to think. I feel it 
most strongly when I'm reading. I used to find it 
easy to immerse myself in a book or a lengthy 
article. My mind would get caught up in the 
twists of the narrative or the turns of the 
argument, and I'd spend hours strolling through 
long stretches of prose. That's rarely the case 
anymore. Now my concentration starts to drift 
after a page or two. I get fidgety, lose the thread, 
begin looking for something else to do.”9 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Relationships 

God’s Design Excessive Screen Time 

  
 
[Addictive use of social media was related to 
higher narcissism by reflecting a need to feed the 
ego and attempt to inhibit a negative self-
evaluation]10 
 
[People often utilize Facebook] “to look 
important, look special and to gain attention and 
status and self-esteem”11 
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“Whenever one has time to write, edit, and 
delete, there is room for performance.”12 
 
“When I ask, ‘What’s wrong with conversation?’ 
answers are forthcoming. A young man in his 
senior year of high school makes things clear: 
‘What’s wrong with conversation? I’ll tell you 
what’s wrong with conversation! It takes place in 
real time and you can’t control what you’re going 
to say.’ This reticence about conversation in ‘real 
time’ is not confined to the young. Across 
generations, people struggle to control what feels 
like an endless stream of ‘incoming’ – 
information to assimilate and act on and 
interactions to manage. Handling things online 
feels like the beginning of a solution: At least we 
can answer questions at our convenience and 
edit our responses to get them ‘right.’”13 
 
 
“It’s our generation’s crack cocaine. People are 
addicted. We experience withdrawals. We are so 
driven by this drug, getting just one hit elicits 
truly peculiar reactions….I’m talking about 
Likes.”14 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
“Technology is seductive when what it offers 
meets our human vulnerabilities. And as it turns 
out, we are very vulnerable indeed. We are 
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lonely but fearful of intimacy. Digital connections 
and the sociable robot may offer the illusion of 
companionship without the demands of 
friendship. Our networked life allows us to hide 
from each other, even as we are tethered to each 
other. We’d rather text than talk.”15 
 

 
 
The Church 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
A Balanced Approach 
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